
Chris Mowat brings together under­
standings of divinatory traditions and 
of gender in the Late Roman Republic 
to consider how each influenced the 
performative nature of the other. The 
identity of the divinatory actor(s) is 
an important element that plays a part 
in confirming the correctness of inter­
pretations, and as such gender is an 
important aspect in understanding 
divination within Roman religious 
traditions.
Beginning with Cicero’s “On Divina­
tion”, Mowat s reading shows how 
gender is axiomatic to - but never 
explicit in - the opposing viewpoints 
presented. Four extended case studies 

follow, each focusing on a specific 
divinatory tradition: the Sibylline 
Books, as written prophetic guides for 
the State; the portentous nature of the 
birth of an intersex child under the 
Republic, and the ritual response it 
garnered; the sacrificial specialism of 
individual diviners, specifically through 
the story of a woman named Martha; 
and, finally, the construction of pro­
phetic dreaming in the Roman Repub­
lic. Together, these studies demonstrate 
how the performativity of gender in­
formed, but was also informed by, the 
performativity of divination in the 
Roman world, in a reciprocal and insep­
arable relationship.


