
Crime and insecurity are top 
public policy concerns in Lat­
in America. Political leaders 
offer tough-on-crime solu­
tions that include increased 
policing and punishments, 
and decreased civilian over­
sight. These solutions, while 
apparently supported by pub­
lic opinion, sit in opposition 
to both criminological re­
search on crime control and 
human rights commitments. 
Moreover, many political and 
civil society actors disagree 
with such rhetoric and poli­
cies. In Tough on Crime, Bon­
ner explores why some voic­
es and some constructions of 
public opinion come to dom­
inate public debate. Draw­
ing on a comparative analy­
sis of Argentina and Chile, 
based on over 190 in-depth 
interviews, and engaging the 
Euro-American literature on 
punitive populism, this book 
argues that a neoliberal media 
system and the resulting ev­
eryday practices used by jour­
nalists and state and civil ac­
tors are central to explaining 
the dominance of tough-on-
crime discourse. 


