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PREFACE 
 
 
This volume of the CEUR-WS proceedings contains the accepted papers of the Research 
Projects Exhibition, held in conjunction with the 36th International Conference on Advanced 
Information Systems Engineering (CAiSE 2024). This edition of CAiSE was hosted by the 
University of Cyprus and took place in Limassol (Cyprus) between June 3rd and 7th. We were 
delighted to contribute to this conference with the second edition of the Research Projects 
Exhibition. 
 
The CAiSE conference is known for being the premier venue for innovative and rigorous 
research across the broad spectrum of information systems engineering. CAiSE 2024 featured 
a Research Project Exhibition (RPE@CAiSE’24) where researchers and practitioners could 
present their ongoing research projects (e.g., H2020 or ERC projects, national grants) in the 
context of Information Systems Engineering. The main objective of this call was to serve as a 
forum where presenters could disseminate the intermediate results of their projects or get 
feedback about research project proposals being developed. The exhibition also provided a 
warm environment to find potential research partners, foster existing relationships, and discuss 
research ideas. 
 
The RPE@CAiSE’24 received 15 submissions, all of which have been reviewed by three 
program committee members. Nine papers have been selected to be presented during this event 
and included in these proceedings. 
 
We would like to express our gratitude to all members involved in the reviewing process. While 
we acknowledge the RPE@CAiSE’24 participants for their active contributions, we would also 
like to thank all those candidates who submitted their work but unfortunately did not get 
selected. Finally, we are grateful to all members of the CAiSE 2024 organisation committees 
– Prof. Pnina Soffer, Prof. Haralambos Mouratidis, and Prof. George A. Papadopoulos – for 
making this event possible and memorable. 
 
June 2024  

Raimundas Matulevičius 
Henderik A. Proper 
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